
jftLVªh laö Mhö ,yö&33004@99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99 

 

vlk/kj.k    

EXTRAORDINARY 

Hkkx II—[k.M 3—mi&[k.M (i) 

PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i) 

izkf/dkj ls izdkf'kr    

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

la-  282]    ubZ fnYyh]        eaxyokj]    ebZ 27] 2014@ T;s"B 6] 1936     

No. 282] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, MAY 27, 2014/JYAISTHA 6, 1936 

भारतीय �रज़व� बक 
(�वदेशी म�ुा �वभाग) 

(क� ��य काया�लय) 

अ�धसचूना 
मुंबई, 28 अ(ैल, 2014 

�वदेशी म�ुा (बंध (माल और सेवाओ ंका /नया�त) (संशोधन) �व/नयमावल�, 2014 

सा.का./न. 362(अ).—�वदेशी म�ुा (बंध अ�ध/नयम, 1999 (1999 का 42) क6 धारा 7 क6 उप-धारा (1) के खंड (ए), उप-

धारा (3) और धारा 47 क6 उप-धारा (2) >वारा (द?त शिAतयB का (योग करत ेहुए एव ं23 जलुाई, 2008 क6 अ�धसचूना स.ं फेमा. 

176/2008-आरबी >वारा यथा संशो�धत 3 मई, 2000 क6 अ�धसूचना स.ं फेमा. 23/2000-आरबी म� आंIशक संशोधन करत े हुए 

भारतीय �रज़व� बक, समय-समय पर यथा संशो�धत, �वदेशी म�ुा (बंध (माल और सेवाओ ंका /नया�त) �व/नयमावल�, 2000 म� 

/नJनIलKखत संशोधन करता है, अथा�त: 

1. संMNOत नाम और (ारंभ 

(i) ये �व/नयम �वदेशी म�ुा (बंध (माल और सेवाओ ंका /नया�त) (संशोधन) �व/नयमावल�, 2014 कहलाएंगे। 

(ii) व े1 अ(ैल, 2013 स ेलागू समझ ेजाएंगे।@ 

2. �व/नयमB म� सशंोधन 

�वदेशी म�ुा (बंध (माल और सेवाओ ंका /नया�त) �व/नयमावल�, 2000 (3 मई, 2000 क6 अ�धसचूना स.ं फेमा. 23/2000-आरबी) 

(अब इसके आगे "मलू �व/नयमावल�" के Uप म� उिVलKखत) म� /नJनIलKखत संशोधन Wकए जाएंगे, अथा�त:- 

(i)      �व/नयम 9 म�, उप-�व/नयम (1) म�, 

     (ए) "बारह माह" शXदB को "नौ माह शXदB" स े(/तZथा�पत Wकया जाएगा। 

     (बी) तीसरे परंतकु म�, "बारह माह" शXदB को "नौ माह शXदB" स े(/तZथा�पत Wकया जाएगा। 

(ii)      �व/नयम 10 म�, "बारह माह" शXदB को "नौ माह शXदB" स े(/तZथा�पत Wकया जाएगा। 

[स.ं फेमा. 302/2014-आरबी] 

सी. डी. ]ी/नवासन, मु̂ य महा(बंधक 
2197 GI/2014 (1) 

 



2   THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY                        [PART II—SEC. 3(i)] 

 

 

पाद _टOपणी: 

(1) @ यह Zपbट Wकया जाता है Wक इन �व/नयमB को पूव� (भावी Wकए जान ेस े Wकसी भी cयिAत पर कोई (/तकूल (भाव नह� ं

पड़गेा। 

(2) मलू �व/नयमावल� 8 मई 2000 के सा.का./न.स.ं409(अ) के ज�रये सरकार� राजपe के भाग II, खडं 3, उप-खंड (i) म� (काIशत 

और त?पfचात ्/नJनIलKखत >वारा संशो�धत क6 गयी थी: 

a. 21 माच�, 2001 के सा. का. /न. स.ं 199(अ), 

b. 8 जलुाई, 2002 के सा. का. /न. स.ं 473(अ), 

c. 29 Iसतंबर, 2003 के सा. का. /न. स.ं 773(अ), 

d. 22 नवंबर, 2003 के सा. का. /न. स.ं 900(अ), 

e. 23 अ(ैल, 2004 के सा. का. /न. स.ं 279(अ), 

f. 8 जनू, 2004 के सा. का. /न. स.ं 352(अ), 

g. 5 अगZत, 2008 के सा. का. /न. स.ं 576(अ), 

h. 17 _दसJ बर, 2012 के सा. का. /न. स.ं 896(अ) 

i. 29 मई, 2013 के सा. का. /न. स.ं 342 (अ) 

 
RESERVE BANK OF INDIA 

(Foreign Exchange Department) 

(CENTRAL OFFICE) 

NOTIFICATION 

Mumbai, the 28th April , 2014 

Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods & Services) (Amendment) Regulations, 2014 

G.S.R. 362(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by clause (a) of sub-section (1), sub-section (3) of Section 

7 and sub-section (2) of Section 47 of the Foreign Exchange Management Act, 1999 (42 of 1999) and in partial 

modification of its Notification No. FEMA. 23/2000-RB dated May 3, 2000 as amended vide Notification  

No. FEMA. 176 /2008-RB dated July 23, 2008, Reserve Bank of India makes the following amendment in the Foreign 

Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) Regulations, 2000, as amended from time to time, namely: 

1. Short Title and commencement 

(i) These Regulations may be called the Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) 

(Amendment) Regulations, 2014. 

(ii) They shall deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2013.@ 

2. Amendment to the Regulations 

In the Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) Regulations, 2000 (Notification  

No. FEMA. 23/2000-RB dated May 3, 2000) (hereinafter called “the principal regulations”), the following amendments 

shall be made, namely:- 

(I) in Regulation 9, in sub-regulation (1), 

(a)  for the words “twelve months”, the words “nine months” shall be substituted. 

(b) in the  third proviso, for the words “twelve months”, the words “nine months” shall be substituted. 

(II) in Regulation 10, for the words “twelve months”, the words “nine months” shall be substituted. 

[No. FEMA 302 /2014-RB] 

C. D. SRINIVASAN, Chief General Manager 

Foot Note:  
(i) @It is clarified that no person will be adversely affected as a result of retrospective effect being given to these 

Regulations. 

(ii) The Principal Regulations were published in the Official Gazette vide G.S.R. No. 409(E) dated May 8, 2000 in 

Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) and subsequently amended vide 

(a) G.S.R. No. 199(E) dated March 21, 2001 

(b) G. S. R. No. 473(E) dated July 8, 2002 

(c) G. S. R. No. 773(E) dated September 29, 2003 

(d) G. S. R. No. 900(E) dated November 22, 2003 

(e) G. S. R. No. 279(E) dated April 23, 2004 

(f) G. S. R. No. 352(E) dated June 8, 2004 

(g) G. S. R. No. 576(E) dated August 5, 2008 

(h) G. S. R. No. 896(E) dated December 17, 2012 

(i) G.S.R. No. 342(E) dated May 29, 2013 

Printed by the Manager, Government of  India Press, Ring  Road,  Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054 


