T Ho Eto Te0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of Iundia

9T [[—|ue 3—3U-"ve (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

YIReRT | WehTioTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 282] ¢ fooelt, WieEr, 78 27, 2014/ S 6, 1936
No. 282] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, MAY 27, 2014/JYAISTHA 6, 1936

AR Red &%
(Rreeft a1 faremmem)
(Fr Frater)
ey
Has, 28 arlid, 2014
el Fger vy (arer 3 dand 1 i) (@utve) Rfegemad, 2014
wrFLfA. 362(3n).—Red Fer yaw afAfam, 1999 (1999 #FT 42) #ir 4rT 7 #Y 3T-URT (1) F TS (T), 39-
URT (3) AR URT 47 A IT-URT (2) GART Yeed ATFAAT FT TAT FIA §C TG 23 Folré, 2008 H1 HfAgaem €. Fa.
176/2008-3X &aRT FuT FNfda 3 #§, 2000 1 HAYI & AT 23/2000-3RH # HRF FAMUAT FA §C
o Rerd 3%, waa-wag W Igr dfta, Rl gar wer (@e sk danet &1 i) Rfagemeeh, 2000 #
RArafaf@a gy wear g, gt
1. wfgrea s 3l gt
(i) ¥ Rfeaw Rdel Fer vaw (@rer 3 Qanat F1 Aeia) (@eve) RfagamEed, 2014 Fgamn
(i) ¥ 1 e, 2013 @ &W] FAS AN @
2. RAfF=A & Faua
el er way (@ AR Fawt w1 AATE) RfagwEE, 2000 (3 #F, 2000 Fr fgEar §. BAT. 23/2000-376)
(319 & M A RAfTEEd” F v A sfeaf@a) & Fefaf@a datue fFo seer, st
(1) R 9 &, su-RfEEE (1) #,
(v) "IRE A" el H "Al A s F wfarwmRa RFar seem)
(@) e WaF A, "IN A"yl F A AF weal & wiaenRa R e
(i) RfATA 10 #, "IRg A" Usal F "At A qsEl” T wfarwRa Far sream|
[@. $AT. 302/2014-3141]

. . shfaarwe, geg AevauF
2197 G1/2014 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

qre feoqufl:

(1) @ 77 ¥ose BFar arar § & s RfawAl & @ vardt e 9@ @ & s e ® #15 wRga wmE a8
g39m|

(2) 7w Rfagamae 8 7§ 2000 F WLFLAF.409(3) F INA WFH To9x & &7er 11, @3 3, 39-@s () # TR
3t aewear Arafaf@a garr anfa i = o

21 A, 2001 & @1, #1. . F. 199(37),

8 Ja1$, 2002 ¥ &T. F. f. H. 473(30),

29 fAdeT, 2003 ¥ 41. 1. A, @ 773(37),

22 Ag=Y, 2003 & &I F1. A F. 900(37),

23 3rdd, 2004 & @1 F1. @ F. 279(31),

8 S+, 2004 ¥ @I FI. f. €. 352(30),

5 37aEd, 2008 & T FI. . F. 576(31),

17 fem+aR, 2012 & @1 F1. . H. 896(37)

i. 29 @S, 2013 & WI. F1. . H. 342 (31)

ISH

e o

5@ om0

RESERVE BANK OF INDIA
(Foreign Exchange Department)
(CENTRAL OFFICE)
NOTIFICATION
Mumbai, the 28th April , 2014
Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods & Services) (Amendment) Regulations, 2014
G.S.R. 362(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by clause (a) of sub-section (1), sub-section (3) of Section
7 and sub-section (2) of Section 47 of the Foreign Exchange Management Act, 1999 (42 of 1999) and in partial
modification of its Notification No. FEMA. 23/2000-RB dated May 3, 2000 as amended vide Notification
No. FEMA. 176 /2008-RB dated July 23, 2008, Reserve Bank of India makes the following amendment in the Foreign
Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) Regulations, 2000, as amended from time to time, namely:
1. Short Title and commencement
(i) These Regulations may be called the Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services)
(Amendment) Regulations, 2014.
(i) They shall deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2013.@
2. Amendment to the Regulations
In the Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) Regulations, 2000 (Notification
No. FEMA. 23/2000-RB dated May 3, 2000) (hereinafter called “the principal regulations”), the following amendments
shall be made, namely:-
(D) in Regulation 9, in sub-regulation (1),
(a) for the words “twelve months”, the words “nine months” shall be substituted.
(b) in the third proviso, for the words “twelve months”, the words “nine months” shall be substituted.
(ID) in Regulation 10, for the words “twelve months”, the words “nine months” shall be substituted.
[No. FEMA 302 /2014-RB]
C. D. SRINIVASAN, Chief General Manager

Foot Note:
@) @It is clarified that no person will be adversely affected as a result of retrospective effect being given to these
Regulations.

(ii) The Principal Regulations were published in the Official Gazette vide G.S.R. No. 409(E) dated May 8§, 2000 in
Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) and subsequently amended vide
(@)  G.S.R.No. 199(E) dated March 21, 2001

(b) G.S.R.No.473(E) dated July 8, 2002

(¢)  G.S.R.No. 773(E) dated September 29, 2003
(d) G.S.R.No.900(E) dated November 22, 2003
(¢) G.S.R.No.279(E) dated April 23, 2004

(f)  G.S.R. No. 352(E) dated June 8, 2004

(g G.S.R.No.576(E) dated August 5, 2008

(h)  G.S.R. No. 896(E) dated December 17, 2012

1) G.S.R. No. 342(E) dated May 29, 2013

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054




